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A.   BRUNSWICK & ADELAIDE 19 

Application BH2009/01835, 2 & 3 Cavendish Mews, Hove. Appeal 
against refusal to grant planning permission for rear balconies to nos 2 
& 3 Cavendish Mews and installation of patio doors to the same. 
APPEAL DISMISSED (Delegated). 
 

 

B.    WITHDEAN 21 

Application BH2009/02193, 27 Glen Rise, Brighton. Appeals against 
refusal to grant planning permission for removal of existing bungalow 
roof and construction of an extension to the rear and at first/second 
floor levels to form a three storey dwelling. APPEAL ALLOWED 
(Delegated). 
 

 

C.    ROTTINGDEAN COASTAL 23 

Application BH2010/00651, 3 Ovingdean Close, Brighton. Appeal 
against refusal to grant planning permission for an extension to rear 
and side of property, comprising at ground floor a garage, utility room 
and kitchen and some internal alterations to ground floor layout to 
facilitate proposal. Also some alterations at first floor to existing 
bedroom/shower room, the formation of an additional bedroom over 
new kitchen extension at first floor. APPEAL DISMISSED (Delegated). 
 

 

D.   ST PETERS & NORTH LAINE 25 

Application BH2010/00141, 29 Park Crescent Terrace, Brighton. 
Appeal against refusal to grant planning permission for construction of 
new rear roof extension, alterations to existing rear outbuilding and new 
fence on north east boundary. APPEAL ALLOWED (Delegated). 
 

 

E.   ST PETERS & NORTH LAINE 27 

Application BH2009/02970, 113 Queens Road, Brighton. Appeal 
against refusal to grant express consent for one mesh type banner 
measuring 9.4m square to fit north wall.  APPEAL DISMISSED 
(Delegated). 
 

 

F.   ST PETERS & NORTH LAINE 29 

Application BH2009/00969, 51 St Luke’s Terrace, Brighton. Appeal 
against refusal to grant planning permission for extension and 
alteration of garage to form a one bedroom house. APPEAL 
DISMISSED (Delegated). 
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